BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Madison County, Mississippi

E-911 Administration Office 146 W. Center Street, Room 203, PO Box 608, Canton, MS 39046
T: (601) 859-6485 F:(601) 859-4743

DATE: December 21, 2015
TO: Madison County Board of Supervisors
FROM: Butch Hammack
Emergency Management Office
RE: Road Claim
Jelica Worthy

After further investigation on the above referenced claim, it is the recommendation of the
Emergency Management Office to approve and pay the claim to the order of Jelica Worthy in
the amount of $62.99 for stated repairs. If any further information is needed, please contact
our office.

Reported area was not repaired within the 7 day period allotted per Madison County Road
Claim Policy.



| ROAD CLAIM INCIDENT REPORT
in order to process the claim, please print & fill out completely and return to Madison Co. EMA office along
| with two signed estimates for damages being claimed. All required paperwork must be returned within 7
5 days of incident. NOTE: Our policy is a reimbursement policy. We DO NOT replace nor arrange to have any '
i repairs made. ILis to your own discretion to when the repairs are made. If your claim is approved a

| reimbursement check will mailed Lo you at the given address given below, |
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Incident Please write a briefl sur nmary of Lho incident (use back if needed):
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MADISON COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF ROAD MANAGEMENT
VEHICLE /EQUIPMENT ACCIDENT FORM

... Conlact Person; He[en [4 e.((efj S Phone: _ ot ~855—-656 13
. Date of Accident: laglcs T

) LOCATIONOFACCIDENT Yandeo d - @cﬂ c_gh'f'on m.§'
TIME OF ACCIDENT; ‘o .M.

RATVE REPORT/SUMMARY OF AcciD) S
ClAlmAanE R Do-H\o a—(; dl\a e.g-(-rAf\f’& of the Jhetd Stabon
n_Yan ' OCKJ‘ €acke— . . .
DriversName; ____ A/ /Q DOB:
‘Last Name, - [ First Name oM. MDY
DriversLicenseNo, -~ . State:
Address; _ _ . '
.~ Telephone Number; Ofﬂce .- Home:
. Check one: CountyVehicle — County Equipment__.__ - Inventory Number
-Veh:cIeIEqulpment Identlf‘cat(on Number: ___ .. .
Year: — ——— Make: = Mode:
. Description of Injuries, if any; _ '
Damages to Your Vehicle:
. Authority Notified: ‘
Were Pictures Taken: —Yes No

s

. Officer'sName: - - - . - ' -Réport or File Number;

OTHER PERSQN(s) INVOLVED .
_Name: U—e.l« el A \{\/O r-(-t'u_/ . DOB:

Address___| 8o Y}anfe.&( {ZOQ Can'(-'Oh m f 3QDL{(¢,

Driver’s License Number: ___

Wotk Mot overk 0l Tel~ 067

VEHICLE INVOLVED A .. l/

Is this a county vehicle/piece of equipment? yas i no

Vehicle ldentification Number: X S Lic Plate Number;

Year: __ Q005 ' Make Fowrgl . Model: _ M QSf-dha

- _— - 19

Description of ln]unes‘ if any NN .
. Damages to Vehjcle: _ bﬁ (( 1 oynt dag. MQQQO? i

Injuries: A (A~ Nature: . Fatality:
. Hospital: __ . City: . State:

‘Vehicles Towed: __ s
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futoZone 2097
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Linfted Usrranty
If a part failds during the varrenty
perfod shoun on this receipt, bring the
part to any AutsZone store and you vit)
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dsrranty excivdes damase caused by
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rights. and you nay also have other
rights vhich vary froa state to-stats.

Take a survey for a
chance to win $10000

at uwwy,.autozonecaras.com
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ADVANCE AUTO PARTS
By: TONY
STORE #: 05392
632 HIGHWAY 51
RIDGELAND MS 39157
(601) 605-2504

2005 Ford Mustang
Vehicle |[4.0L 245 -V6 FI - - Found in 100% of
Vehicles

Part Manufacturer |Moog

Part Type | Ball Joint (66)

[Front Lower; Problem Solver - Includes
Powdered-Metal Gusher Bearing To Allow
Part Description | Grease To Penetrate Bearing Surfaces; 2
Req. - LIMITED LIFETIME
REPLACEMENT

12/1/2015
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Part Number | K500033

N %32.99 ** Prices Subject to Change

ithout Notice.
Part Core Charge | $0.00

Part Price

12/1/2015



Jennifer Taylor

From: Helen Kell
Sent: Tuesday,
To: Jennifer T

Subject: Re: Road ClLaim

Good Morning!
Yes, it was. Will get that to you shortly.

Helen Keller

Office Manager
Madison County
Road Department
601-855-5673 office
601-573-9740 cell
601-859-5857 fax

On Dec 8, 2015, at 9:05 AM, Jennifer Taylor <Jennifer.Taylor@madison-co.com> wrote:

Good Morning dear! Has any road work been done to the pot hole in front of the Shell station
on Yandell that we got that road claim on?

Madison County Emergency Management/ E-911 Admin
1633 W. Peace Street

Canton, MS 39046

T: 601-855-5620

F: 601-859-4743



Jennifer Taylor

From: Helen K
Sent: Thursd
To: Jennifer

Subject: RE: Road CLaim

It has not been done.

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Tuesday, December 08, 2015 9:06 AM
To: Helen Keller

Subject: Road ClLaim

Good Morning dear! Has any road work been done to the pot hole in front of the Shell station on Yandell
that we got that road claim on?

Jennifer Carpenter

Madison County Emergency Management/ E-911 Admin
1633 W. Peace Street

Canton, MS 39046

T: 601-855-5620

F: 601-859-4743



